



ck# 4033167  
12/26/12

Record Date:  
Created By:  
Created On:

Modified By: medinat  
Modified On:

Document Description: Legal services related to investigation by County  
Extended Description:

Actual Amount:  
Cited Authority:

Record Date:  
Created By: medinat  
Created On: 12-10-2012

Modified By:  
Modified On: 12-19-2012

Document Description: Attorney  
Extended Description:

Actual Amount: \$ 47,810.00  
Cited Authority: ADM REIMB 3RD PARTY

Vendor Cust: V00000910587  
Legal Name: LAW OFFICES OF BRIAN ROARK  
Alias / DBA:  
Address: 1307 West Ave  
  
Austin, Texas 78701

Disbursement Category: REG  
Schedule Payment Date: 2012-12-10  
Disbursement Priority: 99  
Disbursement Type: 1  
Disbursement Format: REG

Single Payment:   
Handling Code: SP

AT

Acct Line: 1  
Budget FY:  
Fiscal Year:  
Period:

Event Type: AP01  
Service From Date: 2011-04-11  
Service To Date: 2012-12-24

Bank Account: 23  
Vendor Invoice No: COA#6505  
Vendor Invoice Ln: 1  
Vendor Invoice Dt: 2012-10-24

Line Amount: \$ 47,810.00

Check Description: Legal services related to investigation by County Attorney into allegations concerning Texas Open Meetings

Line Description:

Fund Dept Unit & Sub Appr Objt & Sub Rev & Sub BSA & Sub Actv Func Rptg Task Order Maj Prog Program Pgm Pd

Acct Line:  
Budget FY:  
Fiscal Year:  
Period:

Event Type:  
Service From Date:  
Service To Date:

Bank Account:  
Vendor Invoice No:  
Vendor Invoice Ln:  
Vendor Invoice Dt:

Line Amount:

Check Description: Act-Leffingwell

Line Description: Legal services related to investigation by County Attorney into allegations-Texas Open Meeting Act

Fund Dept Unit & Sub Appr Objt & Sub Rev & Sub BSA & Sub Actv Func Rptg Task Order Maj Prog Program Pgm Pd  
5150 5700 5711 570057BA 5620

Law Offices of Brian Roark 1307 West Avenue, Austin, Texas 78701  
 Tel: 512-476-1900  
 Itemized Statement - In the Matter of LL  
 April 10, 2011 to Present

<b>DATE</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</b>	<b>TIME</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>TOTAL</b>
4/11/11	Meeting with client	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
2/23/2011	Review of letter to City regarding civil litigation	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
3/5/2011	Review of City city pleadings in civil lawsuit	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
3/24/2011	Review letter from Ken Martin to County Attorney's Office	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
3/25/2011	Meeting with County Attorney's Office	2.50	\$350.00	\$875.00
3/25/2011	Research	2.50	\$350.00	\$875.00
3/25/2011	Meeting with County Attorney's Office	3.00	\$350.00	\$1,050.00
3/26/2011	Meeting with client	2.00	\$350.00	\$700.00
3/26/2011	Research	5.00	\$350.00	\$1,750.00
3/26/2011	Meeting with client	2.00	\$350.00	\$700.00
3/28/2011	Research & draft letter to County Attorney's Office	7.00	\$350.00	\$2,450.00
3/29/2011	Email review & research + phone meeting with County Attorney's Office	6.00	\$350.00	\$2,100.00
3/29/2011	Phone meeting with City Attorney's Office	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
3/30/2011	Email review	2.00	\$350.00	\$700.00
3/30/2011	Research	3.00	\$350.00	\$1,050.00
3/30/2011	Email to statesman	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
3/31/2011	Write letter to County Attorney's Office	0.60	\$350.00	\$210.00
3/31/2011	Meeting with client	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00

Law Offices of Brian Roark 1307 West Avenue, Austin, Texas 78701

Tel: 512-476-1900

Itemized Statement - In the Matter of LL

April 10, 2011 to Present

<b>DATE</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</b>	<b>TIME</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>TOTAL</b>
3/31/2011	Email from City	0.10	\$350.00	\$35.00
4/1/2011	Review letter to City from County Attorney's Office	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
4/3/2011	Email review & research	4.00	\$350.00	\$1,400.00
4/4/2011	Read bulldog interviews	3.00	\$350.00	\$1,050.00
4/4/2011	Email from City	0.10	\$350.00	\$35.00
4/4/2011	Email from City	0.10	\$350.00	\$35.00
4/4/2011	Email to City	0.10	\$350.00	\$35.00
4/5/2011	Conflicts research	4.00	\$350.00	\$1,400.00
4/6/2011	Meeting with Defense Lawyer	1.50	\$350.00	\$525.00
4/6/2011	Meeting with City's Counsel	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
4/10/2011	Email to client	0.10	\$350.00	\$35.00
4/11/2011	Review of letter to County Attorney's Office	0.40	\$350.00	\$140.00
4/12/2011	Review of letter to County Attorney's Office	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
4/12/2011	Meeting with client	2.00	\$350.00	\$700.00
4/13/2011	Research Open Records	2.00	\$350.00	\$700.00
4/19/2011	Meeting with County Attorney's Office	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
4/20/2011	Email from client	0.50	\$350.00	\$175.00
4/21/2011	Email from City's Counsel	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
4/28/2011	Review of letter from County Attorney's Office to opposing Counsel	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00

Law Offices of Brian Roark 1307 West Avenue, Austin, Texas 78701  
 Tel: 512-476-1900  
 Itemized Statement - In the Matter of LL  
 April 10, 2011 to Present

<b>DATE</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</b>	<b>TIME</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>TOTAL</b>
5/2/2011	Review of PIR to client	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
5/4/2011	Email from client	0.50	\$350.00	\$175.00
5/9/2011	Email from City	0.10	\$350.00	\$35.00
6/7/2011	Review of emails	4.00	\$350.00	\$1,400.00
7/21/2011	Email to client	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
8/3/2011	Research	2.00	\$350.00	\$700.00
8/4/2011	Research	2.00	\$350.00	\$700.00
8/15/2011	Meeting with County Attorney's Office	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
8/16/2011	Email to City	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
8/16/2011	Phone call with County Attorney's Office	0.10	\$350.00	\$35.00
8/16/2011	Phone meeting with client	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
8/17/2011	Draft of PIR to County Attorney's Office	1.50	\$350.00	\$525.00
8/18/2011	Email to attorney	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
8/19/2011	Review of subpeona's	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
8/21/2011	Meeting with client	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
8/22/2011	Meeting with City's Counsel	1.50	\$350.00	\$525.00
8/22/2011	Meeting with City's Counsel	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
8/25/2011	Meeting with Defense Lawyer	1.50	\$350.00	\$525.00
8/26/2011	Meeting with Defense Lawyer	2.00	\$350.00	\$700.00

Law Offices of Brian Roark 1307 West Avenue, Austin, Texas 78701

Tel: 512-476-1900

Itemized Statement - In the Matter of LL

April 10, 2011 to Present

<b>DATE</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</b>	<b>TIME</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>TOTAL</b>
8/29/2011	Meeting with County Attorney's Office	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
8/29/2011	Email from Defense Lawyer	0.10	\$350.00	\$35.00
8/30/2011	Review of emails	4.00	\$350.00	\$1,400.00
8/30/2011	Meeting with County Attorney's Office	0.50	\$350.00	\$175.00
8/30/2011	Letter from County Attorney's Office	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
8/30/2011	Phone call with County Attorney's Office	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
8/31/2011	Email to Defense Lawyer	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
9/1/2011	Phone call with County Attorney's Office requesting business records	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
9/1/2011	Review of emails	2.00	\$350.00	\$700.00
9/1/2011	Review of documents produced to County Attorney's Office by City on behalf of client	4.00	\$350.00	\$1,400.00
9/2/2011	Review of emails	2.00	\$350.00	\$700.00
9/2/2011	Phone Call with Defense Counsel	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
9/6/2011	Review of info provided to City Attorney from City	0.50	\$350.00	\$175.00
9/10/2011	Review letter from County Attorney's Office to City Attorney	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
9/15/2011	Procurement and review of County Attorney's Office records management	0.70	\$350.00	\$245.00
9/19/2011	Review of Documents	4.00	\$350.00	\$1,400.00
9/19/2011	Phone call with client	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
9/24/2011	Phone Call with Defense Counsel	0.50	\$350.00	\$175.00

Law Offices of Brian Roark 1307 West Avenue, Austin, Texas 78701  
 Tel: 512-476-1900  
 Itemized Statement - In the Matter of LL  
 April 10, 2011 to Present

<b>DATE</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</b>	<b>TIME</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>TOTAL</b>
10/2/2011	Meeting with client	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
11/12/2011	Meeting with client	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
12/6/2011	Meeting with County Attorney's Office	1.50	\$350.00	\$525.00
2/3/2012	Meeting with client	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
2/3/2012	Meeting with client	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
2/6/2012	Meeting with client (meeting w/mayor/City /City attorney)	2.00	\$350.00	\$700.00
2/6/2012	Meeting with client	2.00	\$350.00	\$700.00
2/8/2012	Meeting with County Attorney's Office	2.00	\$350.00	\$700.00
4/2/2012	Meeting with County Attorney's Office	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
4/10/2012	Meeting with client	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
6/7/2012	Meeting with defense counsel	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
7/3/2012	Phone meeting with defense counsel	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
7/12/2012	Email from defense counsel	0.30	\$350.00	\$105.00
7/25/2012	Meeting with client	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
7/30/2012	Meeting with defense counsel	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
7/30/2012	Meeting with defense counsel	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
8/3/2012	Meeting with defense counsel	0.70	\$350.00	\$245.00
8/12/2012	Email from defense counsel	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00

Law Offices of Brian Roark 1307 West Avenue, Austin, Texas 78701

Tel: 512-476-1900

Itemized Statement - In the Matter of LL

April 10, 2011 to Present

<b>DATE</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</b>	<b>TIME</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>TOTAL</b>
8/15/2012	Phone Conversation with defense counsel	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
8/16/2012	Email from County Attorney with compliance draft	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
9/25/2012	Review of recent court case	0.70	\$350.00	\$245.00
9/26/2012	Email from County Attorney's Office	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
9/28/2012	Email from County Attorney's Office	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
10/3/2012	Meeting with defense counsel	0.50	\$350.00	\$175.00
10/3/2012	Meeting with defense counsel	0.50	\$350.00	\$175.00
10/8/2012	Meeting with defense counsel	0.50	\$350.00	\$175.00
10/9/2012	Draft compliance agreement and civil settlement agreement	4.00	\$350.00	\$1,400.00
10/10/2012	Meeting with County Attorney	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
10/10/2012	Meeting with County Attorney	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
10/10/2012	Draft compliance agreement	3.00	\$350.00	\$1,050.00
10/11/2012	email from County Attorney's Office	0.50	\$350.00	\$175.00
10/11/2012	Email from County Attorney's Office	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
10/11/2012	Email from County Attorney's Office	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
10/12/2012	Meeting with defense counsel	1.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
10/15/2012	Email from defense counsel	0.50	\$350.00	\$175.00
10/16/2012	Email from County Attorney's Office	0.10	\$350.00	\$35.00
10/17/2012	email from City	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00

Law Offices of Brian Roark 1307 West Avenue, Austin, Texas 78701  
Tel: 512-476-1900  
Itemized Statement - In the Matter of LL  
April 10, 2011 to Present

<b>DATE</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</b>	<b>TIME</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>TOTAL</b>
10/18/2012	Email from County Attorney's Office	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
10/23/2012	email from City	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
10/24/2012	email from County Attorney's Office	0.50	\$350.00	\$175.00
10/24/2012	Email from City	0.20	\$350.00	\$70.00
10/24/2012	Email from City	0.10	\$350.00	\$35.00
<b>TOTALS</b>		<b>136.60</b>		<b>\$47,810.00</b>