



Handwritten notes: U#4033169, 12/24/12

Record Date:
Created By:
Created On:

Modified By: medinat
Modified On:

Document Description: Legal services related to investigation by County
Extended Description:

Actual Amount:
Cited Authority:

Record Date:
Created By:
Created On:

medinat
12-07-2012

Modified By:
Modified On:

12-19-2012

Document Description: Attorney
Extended Description:

Actual Amount:
Cited Authority:
ADM REIMB 3RD PARTY

\$ 24,657.50

Vendor Cust: V00000910711
Legal Name: Joseph A. Turner PC
Alias / DBA:
Address: 1504 West Ave

Austin, Texas 78701

Disbursement Category: REG
Schedule Payment Date: 2012-12-07
Disbursement Priority: 99
Disbursement Type: 1
Disbursement Format: REG

Single Payment:
Handling Code: SP

Handwritten initials: AT

Acct Line: 1
Budget FY:
Fiscal Year:
Period:

Event Type: AP01
Service From Date: 2011-03-25
Service To Date: 2012-10-24

Bank Account: 23
Vendor Invoice No: COA#6503
Vendor Invoice Ln: 1
Vendor Invoice Dt: 2012-11-20

Line Amount: \$ 24,657.50

Check Description: Legal services related to investigation by County Attorney into allegations concerning Texas Open Meetings

Line Description:

Fund Dept Unit & Sub Appr Objt & Sub Rev & Sub BSA & Sub Actv Func Rptg Task Order Maj Prog Program Pgm Pd

Acct Line:
Budget FY:
Fiscal Year:
Period:

Event Type:
Service From Date:
Service To Date:

Bank Account:
Vendor Invoice No:
Vendor Invoice Ln:
Vendor Invoice Dt:

Line Amount:

Check Description: Act-Martinez

Line Description: Legal services related to investigation by County Attorney into allegations-Texas Open Meeting Act

Fund Dept Unit & Sub Appr Objt & Sub Rev & Sub BSA & Sub Actv Func Rptg Task Order Maj Prog Program Pgm Pd
5150 5700 5711 570057BA 5620

Handwritten signature

JOSEPH A. TURNER, P.C.

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
1504 WEST AVENUE
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78701

(512) 474-4892
FAX: (512) 474-8252

* JOSEPH A. TURNER
CHANNING C. NEARY

JEFF N. WILSON
(1974-2006)

* BOARD CERTIFIED CRIMINAL LAW
TEXAS BOARD OF LEGAL SPECIALIZATION

City of Austin

Invoice #
COA#6503

November 20, 2012

STATEMENT FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
Re: Mike Martinez

Date	Description	Hours
3/25/11	Meeting with client	2.00
3/27/11	Call to co-counsel	1.20
3/28/11	Call to client, legal research	1.10
3/29/11	Calls to co-counsel	0.75
3/29/11	Calls from client and review emails, call from co-counsel	2.10
3/30/11	Calls from client, meeting with co-counsel, review email submissions, call to co-counsel	4.25
3/31/11	Meeting with co-counsel, Copies of email and review	2.40
3/31/11	Meeting with client, calls to and from co-counsel, delivery to co-counsel	1.75
3/31/11	Call from co-counsel	0.10
3/31/11	Calls and meeting with co-counsel	1.50
3/31/11	Calls to co-counsel, emails and law discussion	4.15
4/1/11	Call from co-counsel	1.25
4/3/11	Call to and from co-counsel and client	0.30
4/4/11	Call to client	0.10
4/4/11	Review email	0.25
4/5/11	Calls to co-counsel, Research case law	1.75
4/6/11	Call to co-counsel	0.10
4/6/11	Call from client	0.10

4/6/11	Call to client and co-counsel	0.15
4/6/11	Legal research, meeting with co-counsel	1.15
4/7/11	Calls to co-counsel	0.25
4/8/11	Calls to co-counsel	0.15
4/9/11	Call to client	0.10
4/10/11	Call from client	0.10
4/11/11	Call to co-counsel	0.15
4/11/11	Call to County Attorney	0.10
4/11/11	Call from County Attorney	0.15
4/13/11	Calls to co-counsel and client	0.75
4/15/11	Calls from co-counsel and client	1.15
4/18/11	Call to and from County Attorney and co-counsel	0.65
4/19/11	Meeting with County Attorney, call to co-counsel	2.75
4/19/11	Legal research	0.25
4/19/11	Call from co-counsel	0.25
4/21/11	Call from co-counsel	0.25
4/27/11	Call to co-counsel, Review county attorney letter and blog	0.75
4/28/11	Call from co-counsel, Call to client	0.25
5/15/11	Call to co-counsel	0.10
5/19/11	Meeting with co-counsel	1.40
5/23/11	Call to client	0.10
6/8/11	Call to client	0.20
7/16/11	Meeting with attorney	0.20
7/16/11	Call to client	0.10
8/16/11	Call to client	0.15
8/17/11	Call to County Attorney	0.25
8/17/11	Call to co-counsel	0.10

8/17/11	Call to reporter	
8/19/11	Call to co-counsel	0.10
8/19/11	Review subpoena	0.25
8/19/11	Call to client	0.10
8/22/11	Meeting with co-counsel	0.75
8/24/11	Call to client	0.10
8/24/11	Call from client	0.20
8/29/11	Call from client	0.15
8/30/11	Calls to co-counsel, County Attorney, client and review email	1.75
8/30/11	Review emails, calls to County Attorney and client and provided to County Attorney personal email request	2.15
8/31/11	Meeting with co-counsel	0.20
9/2/11	Call to co-counsel	0.25
9/16/11	Call from co-counsel	0.15
9/20/11	Call to co-counsel	0.10
9/20/11	Review submitted list of items	0.75
9/20/11	Call to co-counsel	0.25
11/3/11	Call from co-counsel, call to client	0.40
11/3/11	Copy of transcripts from meeting	0.25
11/4/11	Return call to co-counsel	0.10
11/8/11	Meeting with County Attorney, Call to co-counsel and review of documents	1.75
11/8/11	Copy of Documents	0.25
11/11/11	Interview reviewed, submission reviewed	0.25
11/15/11	Meeting with co-counsel	1.00
11/29 /11	Delivery of materials to County Attorney	0.25
11/29/11	Call to County Attorney	0.10

1/15/12	Cover letter and review of notes	0.75
1/25/12	Call to County Attorney	0.10
1/25/12	Call to County Attorney	0.15
1/25/12	Call to client	0.10
1/25/12	Call back	0.10
1/26/12	Call to co-counsel	0.15
1/28/12	Call to County Attorney	0.10
2/6/12	Call from client	0.10
2/7/12	Call to client	0.10
2/7/12	Call to and from co-counsel	0.20
4/17/12	Call from County Attorney and co-counsel	2.25
4/18/12	Call from co-counsel	0.15
4/18/12	Call to County Attorney	0.25
4/18/12	Call to co-counsel	0.25
4/19/12	Call to County Attorney and from co-counsel	0.50
4/20/12	Call to County Attorney and co-counsel	0.65
4/27/12	Call from and to co-counsel	0.25
5/1/12	Call to co-counsel	0.25
6/11/12	Calls to co-counsel, reporter and client	0.40
7/3/12	Meeting with co-counsel	1.25
7/3/12	Call to client	0.10
7/23/12	Call to co-counsel	0.20
7/24/12	Call to client	0.10
7/30/12	Meeting with attorney and review documents with client, Calls to co-counsel	1.50
7/31/12	Call to co-counsel and review agreement	0.75
8/10/10	Call to co-counsel	0.25

10/2/12	Call from County Attorney	0.80
10/3/12	Call to co-counsel, meeting with co-counsel, and call to County Attorney and client	1.75
10/4/12	Meeting with County Attorney	1.25
10/4/12	Call to client	0.15
10/4/12	Review of pre-trial	0.40
10/12/12	Conversation with co-counsel	0.60
10/12/12	Phone calls with County Attorney x3	0.75
10/15/12	Review new agreement, call to client, meeting with co-counsel, call to County Attorney and other attorney and final agreement	2.50
10/17/12	Calls from media, to co-counsel and County Attorney	1.25
10/22/12	Call to County Attorney, Call to co-counsel	0.25
10/23/12	Call from client	0.15
10/24/12	Press release and calls to co-counsel and client	0.25
	Total	69.75

Attorney's fees incurred by Joe Turner (69.75 hours @ \$350.00/hr): \$24,412.50

Expenses incurred

Making copies of notebooks by paralegal: 1.5 hrs @ \$90/hr	\$135.00
440 pages @ \$0.25/page	\$110.00
Total	\$245.00

Balance Due as of 11/20/12 **\$24,657.50**

Please make checks payable to *Joseph A. Turner, P.C.* Thank you.