ATTORNEY & MEDIATOR
1717 N. IH 35, SUITE 300
ROUNC ROCK, TX 78664

512-244-7771 i
-

Invoice submitted to:
HONORABLE DAN GATTIS
710 S, MAIN STREET
GEQRGETOWN, TEXAS 78626

January 29, 2010 L-/D/"'

34-014 Emgarf'l.ma
In Reference To: AT LAW JUDGES' LITIGATION ;) “g 7 S’C
ACCOUNT 2394-014 ;
Tnd - 1% [m Amaunt —
Invoice #12930 L e
Professional Services
Hours
1/4/2010 MPD PHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE BROOKS, 0.30
520
50—

Y FERENCEWITH-IIDGE
HIGGINBOTHAM; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH STEVE MIERL. REVIEW
INFORMATION FROM MIERL.
JMRE-CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE GATTIS AND JUDGE HIGGINBOTHAM™ ) - 450

— 20 MPE—COMNEERENCE WITH MANDY:-PHONE-CONFERENGE- WITHPEGSEY PHONE——— 270

CONFERENCE WITH JANA DUTY, CONFERENCE WITH MANDY; CONFERENCE

WITH PAUL WOODARD, CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE MCMASTER,
—B/2010-MPE—PHONECONFERENGE- WITH LIBA-ZECKEE, PHONE CONFERENGE-WATH-JANA— 1707~

DUTY; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE HIGGINBEOTHAM, CONFERENCE

WITH LISA ZECKLE, STEVE MIERL, JANA DUTY, HANK PREJEAN.

1110/2010 MPD RESEARCH ISSUES RELATING TO MOTION TO DISMISS IN APPELLATE 2.70
COURT, DRAFT MOTION TO DISMISS.
—3111/2010 MPD CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE, PHONE CoNFERENGE- WITH JUDGE-GATTHS 150

CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE BROOKS: CONFERENCE WITH JANA DUTY AND
HANK PREJEAN; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH CRAIG DEATS,
— 42040 MRD RHONE C
AGREEMENT,; REVISE MOTION TO DISMISS.
MRD—PHONE CONFERENCE WITH JANA-DUTY-AND-HENRY-RREJEAN-RELSE G-AG-
AGREEMENT, PHONE CONFERENCE WITH HENRY PREJEAN
L EROM.CRAIG DEATS EMAISANA-BUTY— 160
PHONE CONFERENCE WITH CRAIG DEATS, PHONE CONFERENCE WITH
JANA AND HENRY.
——HH4/2816-MPD CONPERENSE-WITHJUBGE BROOKS -MODIFYING MOTIONTO-BISMISS——— — 3:20—
CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE HIGGINBOTHAM, CONFERENCE WITH JANA
DUTY; REVISE DOCUMENTS; EMAIL DEATS

1115/2010 MPD PHONE CONFERENCE WITH ANDREA MARSH; FINALIZE MOTION; EMAIL 0.80
HANK; LETTER TO CLERK: FILE MOTION
MPD PHONE CONFERENCE WITH HANK PREJEAN. 0.30




HONORABLE DAN GATTIS Page 2
Hours
—411972070 MPD CONFERENCE WITHJUDGE PHONE CONFERENCES WITHIANADUTY, 50—

CONFERENCE WITH JANA DUTY, CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE; CONFERENCE
WITH JUDGE WRIGHT,
1202840-MPE—PHONE CONFERENCEWAITHJANA-DUTY: PHONE-GONFERENCE WITH—— 100
JUDGE; CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE.
1212010-MPB—EONFERENGE-WITH- U BGE PHONE GONFERENCEWITH ERAIG DEATS— — 130

11252610 MPE—CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE, EMAILS TO AND FROM JANA DUTY — 60

WIEL2-MPD CONEERENCEMWITH-UBSEEWATC FROM DEATS. T ———— 1.30

a2t 0-MPEREVIEW AND RESPOND- TO-EMALFROM-JANA-BUTF - PHONECONFERENCE—830
WITH MANDY

— Amount

For professional services rendered 25.80 £5,180.00

Additional Charges °

“HELZID-MIEEAGE __________._-—-—=-‘T'1'UU
4/2i2040-MILEAGE — B — S 3300
482010 MEEAGE —— 1 B
444412015 MILEAGE e 0
+1472040-MILEAGE- il
1152010 CLERK, THIRD COURT OF APFEALS 10.00
POSTAGE 10.12
MILEAGE 11.00
111912010 POSTAGE 488
1/28/2010 PHOTOCOPY CHARGES 36.50
Total costs $127.50

Total amount of this bill

Previous balance @, §2,280. 58
AHHIO ot

Halance due $? 56B8.08

BALANCES ARE PAST DUE AFTER THE 15TH OF THE MONTH

00
-
sep 5277
R v

q5"15.‘3‘u




LAW OFFICES OF MIKE DAVIS

ATTORNEY & MEDIATOR
1717 N. H 35, SUITE 300
ROUND ROCK, TX 78664

512-244-T771

Invoice submitted to: — 7, ) /
HOMNORABLE DAN GATTIS h

710 S. MAIN STREET
GEORGETOWN, TEXAS 78626

February 25, zum/ ” /Y, /E“F'ﬂ“ — [0(7

In Reference To: COUNTY COURT AT LAW JUDGES' LITIGATIONS, | ,«_-;;,_/_‘ ,!(_’_f : CS7
e !

ACCOU T3l -Feb Asip T

Invoice #12969 |~ —

Professional Services ‘

1/31/2010 MPD REVIEW RESPONSE LETTER TO CLIENT. | 0.40
2/2/2010 MPD CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE WRIGHT; CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE BROOKS. 0.40
2/4/2010 MPD PHONE CONFEREMNCE WITH JUDGE REGARDING HECKMAN RESPONSES, .30
2/8/2010 MPD CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE. | 0.30

2/23/2010 MPD PHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOM EASTES; REVIEW MONTYON LOUSSAR 0.80

FOR APPLICATION TO ROTHGUY. '
, Amount
For professional services rendered 2.20 $440.00

Additional Charges :

2/1/2010 POSTAGE
2/25/2010 PHOTOCOPY CHARGES

Total costs

=

\ 52010 i/

Total amount of this bill

Previous bal ILLLiF}%Bf'%Cﬂ"' 4 $7,568.08
revious balance w iSON JOUNT o TR 588,
|
2/4/2010 Payment - Thank You. Check No. 324780 | ($2,280.58) -
2/25/2010 Payment - Thank You. Check No. 325844 i ($5,287.50) pE-
[
Total payments and adjustments . ($7,568.08)

Balance e | $444.57




g™
~LAW-CFEREESOF MIKE DAVIS

ATTORNEY & MEDIATOR
1717 N. IH 35, SUITE 300
ROUND ROCK, TX 78664

512-244-T7T71

Invoice submitied lo
HONORABLE DAN GATTIS
710 5. MAIN STREET
GEORGETOWN, TEXAS 7B626

April 30, 2010 D? ?Harﬁ.,{ -ﬁf‘,f =it H e

In Reference To: %S'UNTV'EUHT AT LAW JUDGES' LITIGATIONS @ S % e
COUNT 2384-014 ey oo ses SLf 2% . .

Mar 1 -Bordflo - et e

Invoice #13059 l// e &v%f?‘&ﬂ Y0 At

Maf %6077
Professional Services s t
T AP AT - N iBGin
3/9/2010 MPD CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE BROOKS REGARDING MONITORS. 0.40
3/19/2010 MPD REVIEW NOTICE OF APPEARANCE, 0.20

—4/620t6-MPE- CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH HANK PREJEAN. 78
+H&2849-MPD LETTER TO TWFCCD; CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE. 68~
~H42046-MPB- PHONE CONFERENCE WITH HANK PREJEAN; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH B85~
JUDGE; RESEARCH ROSENBURG; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH HANK;
REVIEW LETTER FROM HANK PREJEAN,
462010 MPD~ CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE; CONFERENCE WITH HANK PREJEAN. ~+36—

4/23/2010 MPD REVIEW COURT DECISIONS; EMAIL TO CLIENT, PHONE CONFERENCE WITH 0.80
JANA DUTY.
4/26/2010 MPD LETTER TO CLIENT; CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE, PHONE CONFERENCE 0.80
WITH JUDGE BROOKS.
MPD CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE WRIGHT. 0.50
4/28/2010 MPD PHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE. 0.30
4/29/2010 MPD PHONE CONFERENCE WITH REBECCA REGARDING EXTENSION TO FILE 0.40
HEARING EN BANC
Amounl
For professional services rendered 7.70 £1,540.00
Additional Charges ;
A/BR2E18-FAX SENT TO TONY ROBERTSON, TEXAS WORKFORCE COMMISSION & RAY 508
HAMMARTH, TEXAS WORKFORCE COMMISSION (3 PAGES EACH)
POSTAGE :
422070 FAX SENT TO TONY ROBERTSON, TEXAS WORKFORCE COMMISSION & RAY &-66-
HAMMARTH, TEXAS WORKFORCE COMMISSION (3 PAGES EACH)
POSTAGE o8
4/14/2010 FAX RECEIVED FROM COUNTY ATTORNEY'S OFFICE 2.00
4462030 MILEAGE 45-00—

L}, 2w = gf.a{:)‘;
= J
R



HOMORABLE DAN GATTIS Page 2

Amount
~4HPHEG FAX SENT TO EVELYN SMITH, TWCCRD 3,00
4/26/2010 POSTAGE 417
4/29/2010 PHOTQCOPY CHARGES 28.25
Total costs 581.58
Total amount of this bill E 21,621.58 ;
Previous balance 2444 57
3/26/2010 Payment - Thank You. Check No. 327300 (3444 57)
Total payments and adjustments (5444 57)
Balance due $1,621.58

BALANCES ARE PAST DUE AFTER THE 15TH OF THE MONTH



WIQIKE DAVIS |

TONEL MR sl
fet

ROUND ROCK, TX 78664
512-244-7771

Invoice submitted to:
HONORABLE DAN GATTIS
710 5. MAIN STREET
GEORGETOWN, TEXAS TBB26

V

D

)

/ JUN = 82010
AUDITORSO
May 28, 2010 2 IWLL! IMSON COUNTY. TEXAS

3-27//p

In Reference To: COUNTY COURT AT LAW JUDGES' LITIGATIONS

2
Invoice #13100 L//

Professicnal Services

Hours
5/3/2010 MPD REVIEW REQUEST FOR EXTENSION TO FILE EN BANC, PHONE CONFERENCE 0.80
WITH POLENTIA WITNESS: PHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE,
5/472010 MPD CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE BROOKS; REVIEW MOTICON AND ORDER; LETTER 0.30
TO CLIENT.

55120 HMPD CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE: PREPARATION FOR MEDIATION, 45—
EFZEFMRD PREPARATION FOR MEDIATION: RESEARCH PERSOMNAL STAFF ISSUES. S
SH2040-MPD CONFERENCE WITH CLIENT: MEDIATION; CONFERENCE WITH HANK AND ——Eg—

LISA
SP2eHE8-MPE PHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE. n3p—
5/27/2010 MPD REVIEW APPELLEE'S MOTION FOR REHEAR:NG EN BANC; LETTER TO 0.80
CLIENT
— e AtfiOUNL
For professional services rendered 13.70 $2,740.00
Additional Charges
5/6/2010 POSTACGE 1,32
AP PARKING -&00
MILEAGE ~20-00-
§/27/2010 PHOTOCOPY CHARGES e S 14 50
Tolal costs $41.82 _
Tota! amount of this bill y2,7681.82
Date

Previous balance




HONORABLE DAN GATTIS Page 2
Amaount

Balance due $4,403.40

BALANCES ARE PAST DUE AFTER THE 15TH OF THE MONTH



W e
LAW-OFFEeES-0F MIKE DAVIS \I _ ﬂ\lﬂ"\f"\‘

ATTORNEY & MEDIATOR
1717 N. IH 35, SUITE 300
ROUND ROCK, TX 78664

512-244-7T771

Invoice submitted to: . - off ' " A\
HONORABLE DAN GATTIS e :

710 S. MAIN STREET .
GEORGETOWN, TEXAS 78626

*__' '_*_. —
/ L L e

June 30, Egt;q L‘L o1y, \ ;; ' 2(_‘1 ), (., ; e |
In Reference To:  COUNTY COURT AT LAW JUDGES' LITIGATIONS _
"ACCOUNT 2394-014 \ / mpl"-j 28~ Jn 9‘?/{0

Invoice #13140 l/

Professional Services \

b

‘\ Hours
LAabeE-MPD CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE; PHONE B‘QNFERENCE WITH JUDGE. Lt
S252otoPD CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE. %, 835
G025 MPE PHONE CONFERENCE WITH JA.N&DUTY:._ =20
/ \ Amount
For professional services rendered 0.90 $180.00—
Additional Charges |
5/28/2010 POSTAGE o —4-58—
6/29/2010 PHOTOQCOPY CHARGES Vi 1805
Total costs s s & 5758
x\ ﬁ
Frevious balance N\ 34,403 40
6/11/2010 Payment - Thank Ydu. Check No. 331585 h (51,621.58)
6/24/2010 Payment - Thank Xou. Check No. 332358 ' (S2,781.82)
and adjustments _ (S4,403.40)
5202 68
BALANCES ARE/PAST DUE AFTER THE 15TH OF THE MONTH
M d Y

QEM+P Wﬂ i N
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n 1 2 ' Tr.
fer—ri ® { i | ey



