000000004402630

246485

8/24/2018

IN 5700 18082347117

Accounts Payable Invoice

Document Number	Record Date	Created By	Create Date	Modified By	Modify Date	Status	
IN - 5700 - 18082347117 - 1	08-23-2018	blackwellb	08-23-2018	blackwellb	08-23-2018	Final -	_

Budget FY:

2018

Inv By:

Brian Blackwell

Proc ID:

3818517

0

Document Total:

\$ 59,000.00

Fiscal Year:

2018 11

Phone: Inv Loc:

974-2155 **FSC**

Attachments:

Closed Amount:

Period Invoiced Date:

07/26/18

Tracking Date:

Ext:

Doc Function: New

\$ 0.00

Document Descriptions

Document Description: RC *49837 -

Extended Description:

Vendor Inv No:

246485

SCOTT DOUGLASS & MCCONNICO LLP -

Disbursement Format:

REG 99

Handling Code:

Vendor Name: Alias Name:

Vendor Code: Vendor Address:

Colorado Tower

SCO4141000

Disbursement Priority: Disbursement Type: **Disbursement Category:**

Check REG

Schedule Pay Date:

Single Check Flag:

303 Colorado Street, Suite 2400 -

AUSTIN, TX 78701-2589

COMM LINE	1	Vend Inv Ln:	1	Ref Award Ln: 1			
Line Type	Qty	UoM	Comm Code	Commodity Description	Tax Amount	Unit Price	Total Amount
Service	0.00000		91874	Legal Consulting	. \$ 0.00	\$ 0.00	\$ 59,000.00

Service From: 05/31/18 Service To: 06/29/18

Ref Doc: DO 5700 18080113823

Reason:

Reference Type: Final



Federal I.D. No. 74-1864860

ANNE MORGAN CITY OF AUSTIN 301 WEST 2ND, 4TH FLOOR AUSTIN, TX 78701

July 26, 2018 Invoice No. 246485

For Professional Services Rendered:

RE: **CODENEXT DISPUTE**

DATE	INITIALS	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
05/31/18	JMW	Analyze referendum petition and email correspondence with Sara Clark regarding meeting with City Attorney;	0.50
06/01/18	JMW	Meet with Anne Morgan and others from City Attorney's office regarding new lawsuit regarding referendum effort relating to CodeNEXT; Review and analyze materials with Sara Clark;	2.50
06/01/18	SWC	Attend meeting with City attorneys regarding new matter-lawsuit filed regarding CodeNEXT referendum; Review background materials; Begin review of public hearing transcript; Review draft and final council resolutions; Confer with Jane Webre regarding next steps; Review email from B. Heath; Emails with B. Heath regarding coordinating the City's legal defense; Research regarding jurisdiction issues for original mandamus proceedings to compel a public official to act;	2.70
06/03/18	SWC	Review transcript of public hearing; Review background materials and legal memoranda; Research regarding evolution of law preventing zoning from being the subject of public referendum; Analysis of the petition language;	1.50
06/04/18	SWC	Confer with Mary Byars regarding background materials and briefing schedule; Emails regarding accepting service, legislative history, and whether all relators signed the petition; Telephone call with F. Lewis regarding accepting service and proposing a briefing schedule; Telephone call to B. Bunch; Telephone call with Jane Webre regarding background materials and prepare package of same for her review; Draft list of procedural logistical and substantive issues that we need to address; Emails with B. Heath regarding his availability to assist us;	1.90
06/04/18	MWB	Office conference with Sara Clark regarding initial research questions;	1.30
06/04/18	HR	Scan and upload client documents into electronic database;	1.20
06/05/18	JMW	Email correspondence and review materials relating to CodeNEXT challenge lawsuit;	2.30
06/05/18	SWC	Telephone call with F. Lewis and B. Bunch regarding case logistics and evidentiary issues; Telephone call with Jane Webre regarding same, briefing schedule, hearing date, issues presented, and next steps; Email to City attorneys regarding same; Research regarding potential jurisdictional issue; Emails regarding petition pages where relators each signed; Emails	1.00

Scott Douglass & McConnico LLP | Attorneys at Law

002505.0054

303 Colorado Street, Suite 2400, Austin, TX 78701 | p:512.495.6300 | f:512.495.6399 | www.scottdoug.com

SCOTT DOUGLASS & MCCONNICO LLP

CODENEXT DISPUTE July 26, 2018

DATE	INITIALS	DESCRIPTION to City attorneys to update them on developments;	HOURS
06/05/18	CC	Review Henderson briefing and update file with same;	0.30
06/05/18	MLB	Compile binders per paralegal instruction for attorneys;	2.70
06/06/18	JMW	Review materials regarding CodeNEXT suit and analyze procedural issues with Sara Clark; Conference call with team regarding various procedural issues;	4.10
06/06/18	SWC	Review legal research memorandum provided by City attorney's office; Telephone calls and emails with F. Lewis and B. Bunch regarding procedural and evidentiary issues and agreements; Research regarding various statutes implicated in the CodeNEXT process; Brief review of legislative history received from City of Austin; Telephone call with Jane Webre and City attorneys' regarding status, strategy and things to do; Memorandum to file regarding ballot language and confusion issues; Emails regarding obtaining an assigned judge and a hearing date; Draft proposed briefing schedule and many emails regarding same; Confer with Jane Webre regarding procedural issues; Emails regarding Relators' signatures; Research regarding burden of proof in mandamus proceeding and emails to Jane Webre regarding same; Draft proposed email to Relators' counsel regarding need for briefing schedule and confer with Jane Webre regarding same;	3.80
06/06/18	CC	Review USB drive with client documents and organize for attorney review;	0.20
06/07/18	JMW	Review and analyze materials for CodeNEXT suit, including briefing from City of Plano appeal; Telephone conference with Warren Vavra regarding assignment of judge and scheduling; Much email correspondence with team regarding materials and scheduling;	3.50
06/07/18	SWC	Confer with Jane Webre regarding procedural issues, hearing date, legal issues, and next steps; Email to City attorneys regarding recent developments; Emails regarding obtaining a special setting for this matter and need for a briefing schedule; Review Relators' requested evidence list and forward it to the City for review and action; Review City Clerk feedback regarding same;	1.00
06/08/18	JMW	Research and work on analyzing case law regarding withdrawing zoning from the field of initiative and referendum; Review documentary record including reviewing transcript of City Council meetings; Email correspondence with clients regarding potential amicus support; Telephone conference with Warren Vavra regarding assignment of Judge Naranjo;	7.50
06/08/18	SWC	Email to Relators' counsel regarding preliminary list of evidence they have requested; Emails regarding Judge Orlinda Naranjo's requested briefing schedule; Analysis of Chapter 211 of the Local Government Code; Draft demonstrative regarding same; Confer with Jane Webre regarding same; Review case law regarding legislative process argument; Receipt and review of clerk records; Arrange to have them Bates-labeled and file	2.00

CODENEXT DISPUTE July 26, 2018

DATE	INITIALS	DESCRIPTION shared to Relators' counsel; Review additional documents and forward those as well;	HOURS
06/08/18	LG	Work on review, processing and preparing PDFs for production to SOS; Review various emails regarding same; Work with tech support to prepare and serve document production via secure Internet File Share;	2.00
06/08/18	PTP	Review correspondence and file same; Calendar deadlines and e-mail same to attorneys for their review and use; Review case documents and organize same in file;	0.90
06/08/18	MLB	Scanning and re-naming documents to be representative of content, working with paralegal to get documents sent to clients;	3.10
06/10/18	JMW	Continue research and review of materials regarding CodeNEXT process;	2.20
06/10/18	SWC	Confer with Jane Webre regarding coordinating briefing with City attorneys' office, outlining same, and next steps; Update email regarding questions presented; Discuss legal arguments with Jane Webre;	0.70
06/10/18	MWB	Review background materials for Linder v. City of Austin;	1.60
06/11/18	JMW	Work on reviewing materials and analyzing arguments with Sara Clark; Begin drafting trial brief on the merits;	3.30
06/11/18	SWC	Emails regarding additional client documents; Research regarding Current, land development code, and CodeNEXT; Memorandum to Jane Webre regarding statutory procedures implicated by the passage of the non-zoning provisions of CodeNEXT; Emails regarding document production to Relators' counsel; Work on draft order setting hearing and briefing schedule; Confer with Jane Webre regarding CodeNEXT process and provisions and regarding City's legal arguments; Emails regarding further research needed and Relators' burden of proof; Work on possible demonstrative exhibit and confer with Jane Webre regarding same; Legislative history research regarding intent and purpose of Section 211.015; Email to B. Heath regarding setting up a call with him;	3.60
06/11/18	PTP	Review correspondence and file same; Compile documents produced; Assist attorneys with review of client documents for production; Research CodeNext information for production, per attorney instructions; Compile additional documents from City of Austin's web-site re Draft 3 for attorneys to review;	2.60
06/11/18	MLB	Compiling documents to save into firm database; Compiling excel data sheet for doc production; Printing and organizing documents for attorneys to review;	4.00
06/12/18	JMW	Work on drafting trial brief; Meet with City Attorney and team regarding planning and strategy issues; Analyze arguments and evidentiary issues with Sara Clark;	8.40
06/12/18	SWC	Review and revise draft trial brief; Work on scheduling order and letter to Judge Orlinda Naranjo regarding same; Email to Relators' counsel regarding evidentiary record, scheduling order, and related issues; Confer	2.50

SCOTT DOUGLASS & MCCONNICO LLP

CODENEXT DISPUTE July 26, 2018

DATE	INITIALS	DESCRIPTION with Jane Webre regarding edits to draft; Review next iteration of brief; Meet with City attorneys regarding status, strategy, legal arguments, background facts, and next steps; Confer with Jane Webre regarding same; Analysis of planning provisions in City charter; Telephone call with B. Heath and Jane Webre regarding legal arguments;	HOURS
06/13/18	JMW	Work on review and analysis of documents and continue drafting trial brief; Work on getting scheduling order entered;	4.50
06/13/18	SWC	Work on letter to Judge Orlinda Naranjo and proposed scheduling order; Many emails and confer with Jane Webre regarding same; Telephone call to court staff and email to judicial intern regarding same; Multi-state research regarding outcome when multiple topics, both proper and not proper, are attempted to be referred to an election; Confer with Mary Byars regarding same; Calendar answer date;	1.40
06/14/18	SWC	Email to all counsel regarding length of trial; Review of B. Lloyd email and additional materials regarding background facts and emails regarding same; Work on producing additional materials to relators; Work on fact section of the trial brief; Emails with B. Lloyd regarding same; Confer with Mary Byars regarding progress on research project; Review update regarding amicus efforts; Emails regarding additional documents to produce;	5.40
06/14/18	MWB	Research argument that CodeNext process has been removed from initiative and referendum process;	2.50
06/14/18	PTP	Review correspondence and file same; Assist attorney with review of client documents to be produced;	1.30
06/14/18	PTP	Review correspondence and file same; Assist attorney with review of client documents for producition;	0.20
06/15/18	CLD	Emails regarding planning strategy for argument;	0.20
06/15/18	JMW	Analyze arguments and record issues with Sara Clark; Work out hearing logistics and email correspondence regarding same;	4.10
06/15/18	SWC	Confer with Mary Byars regarding her research results; Emails with B. Lloyd regarding protest rights analysis and review his draft memorandum regarding same; Emails with F. Lewis and City attorneys regarding Heath and Morgan memorandum; Emails regarding time announcement and plan for the hearing date; Many emails regarding exchange of exhibit lists; Telephone call with M. Riley regarding media inquiry and next steps; Emails with City attorneys regarding draft fact section; Revise same; Work on agreed exhibit list and City of Austin document production; Many emails regarding same; Review and distribute court's scheduling order; Review proposed Relator's affidavit; Emails regarding same; Emails and confer with Mary Byars regarding Section 211.006 bench brief; Emails regarding video excerpts for evidentiary record; Telephone call with B. Lloyd regarding edits and comments in fact section; Work on document production with IT staff; Analysis of 1445-Single Office Agreement and	4.30

SCOTT DOUGLASS & MCCONNICO LLP

CODENEXT DISPUTE July 26, 2018

DATE	INITIALS	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
		confer with Jane Webre regarding same;	
06/15/18	MWB	Continue researching argument that CodeNext process has been removed from initiative and referendum process;	2.90
06/15/18	PTP	Review correspondence and file same; Assist attorney with production of documents; Calendar deadlines and trial dates and e-mail same to attorneys for their review and use; Compile documents for attorney to send to clients;	2.60
06/16/18	JMW	Go through evidentiary record with Sara Clark; Work on trial brief;	5.00
06/16/18	SWC	Meet with Jane Webre to go over draft brief and each sides proposals for the agreed evidentiary record; Review and revise brief; Draft memorandum to Jane Webre regarding inability to move forward with election that includes impermissible zoning provisions of CodeNEXT;	1.00
06/17/18	JMW	Work on trial brief;	1.10
06/17/18	SWC	Research regarding issue of charter controlling over inconsistent ordinance and emails to Jane Webre regarding same; Confer with Jane Webre regarding arguments and revising draft brief; Work on brief;	1.90
06/18/18	JMW	Telephone conference with Brent Lloyd and Erika Lopez regarding interplay of CodeNEXT provisions; Telephone conference with Meaghan Riley regarding amicus support; Analyze severability issues; Work on trial brief;	4.80
06/18/18	SWC	Review draft exhibit list and emails regarding revisions needed; Email to Relators' counsel regarding the agreed evidentiary record and other documents to be offered at trial; Emails and confer with Jane Webre regarding "tentacles" argument; Telephone call with City attorneys regarding same; Follow up regarding additional certified records needed; Emails and confer with Jane Webre regarding severance arguments and S.O.S. ordinance relevance here; Review printed draft 3 and emails regarding same; Revise exhibit list; Work on document production; Review single office agreement; Follow-up regarding boards and commissions involvement in CodeNEXT process; Emails regarding acceptance of service on behalf of all respondents; Emails regarding likely adoption date of CodeNEXT; Emails regarding new exhibits proposed by relators and add same to the City of Austin document production; Email to Mary Byars regarding objections to Fox News report; Pull research regarding statements of individual council members; Draft CodeNEXT adoption timeline and email Mary Byars regarding election code/charter research needed to complete same;	3.20
06/18/18	MWB	Research general Texas case law regarding severability;	3.70
06/18/18	PTP	Review correspondence and file same; Assist attorney with review of COA documents produced;	0.40
06/18/18	MLB	Compiling documents to create index of City's document production;	3.40
06/19/18	JMW	Work on trial brief and analysis of record materials regarding pervasive	5.80

CODENEXT DISPUTE July 26, 2018

DATE	INITIALS	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
		nature of zoning "tentacles" throughout CodeNEXT; Circulate next generation brief; Much email correspondence regarding "tentacles" issue;	
06/19/18	SWC	Confer with Jane Webre regarding status of briefing, evidence, and argument; Continue work on document production; Confer with team regarding election dates; Work on final judgment; Review trial exhibits agreed upon and marked so far; Emails regarding adjustments needed to same; Follow up regarding requested certification and additional requested documents; Work on exhibit list; Send summary and draft to Relators' counsel; Send new production and revised exhibit list to Relators' counsel; Send list to City attorneys; Telephone call with E. Lopez regarding additional questions regarding CodeNEXT; Review severance research; Emails regarding "tentacles" argument and draft brief;	2.60
06/19/18	MWB	Draft excerpt regarding severance of invalid portions of statutes from valid; Research timing of special elections in Texas and draft email to Sara Clark and Jane Webre regarding same;	3.00
06/19/18	PTP	Review correspondence and file same; Assist attorney with review of COA documents produced; Draft final judgment for attorneys to review and use; Assist attorney with review of Draft 3;	1.90
06/19/18	MLB	Compile documents to create index of City's document production;	0.80
06/20/18	JMW	Work on trial brief and review of documents in evidentiary record; Begin outlining blow-ups and other demonstrative exhibits for hearing; Telephone conference with Meaghan Riley regarding amicus support; Review and analyze trial brief filed by relators;	3.90
06/20/18	SWC	Emails regarding docket call; Review draft briefing; Work on tentacles section of brief; Team meeting to discuss trial plan exhibits and demonstratives; Create demonstrative for tentacles argument; Confer with Mary Byars regarding 211.006 analysis; Review Relators' opening brief; Emails regarding same; Work on joint exhibit list and request trial set of all exhibits; Follow up with Relators' counsel regarding exhibits; Send Relators' brief to B. Heath;	4.90
06/20/18	MWB	Research protest rights; Strategy meeting with Jane Webre, Sara Clark, and Chris Stephens;	5.70
06/20/18	PTP	Review correspondence and file same; Draft docket call announcement for attorney to review and use; Finalize same to fax to court administrator's office; Draft joint exhibit list for attorneys to review and use; Compile joint exhibits for attorneys to review and use; Assist attorneys with preparation for bench trial;	4.00
06/21/18	JMW	Work on trial brief and much research and work with team regarding responding to relators' arguments; Work with Sara Clark to finalize evidentiary record; Much email correspondence regarding same;	7.40
06/21/18	SWC	Review B. Heath, B. Lloyd, and E. Lopez memorandums regarding thoughts for response brief; Emails with Mary Byars and Jane Webre regarding same; Review Zucker report and emails regarding adding it to	3.80

CODENEXT DISPUTE July 26, 2018

DATE	INITIALS	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
		the exhibit list; Revise and finalize the exhibit list; Work on brief; Emails regarding Relators' affidavits; Process Zucker report for production; Emails regarding additional documents and legislative audio recording that relators plan to offer at trial; Review transcript and emails regarding same; Obtain approval to submit joint exhibit list; Confer with Jane Webre regarding appendix items and materials needed for trial; Work on same; Confer with Jane Webre regarding response arguments for brief and research regarding same; Revise brief; Work on demonstratives;	
06/21/18	MWB	Review relators' trial brief; Office conferences with Jane Webre and Sara Clark regarding relators' brief; Research issues raised in relators' brief;	7.50
06/21/18	PTP	Review correspondence and file same; Assist attorney with production of additional COA documents; Assist attorneys with preparation for trial; Assist attorney with joint exhibit list and trial exhibits;	2.30
06/22/18	CLD	Review briefs regarding upcoming trial;	0.50
06/22/18	JMW	Much work to revise, finalize and file trial brief and appendix; Much email correspondence regarding same; Telephone conference with Warren Vavra regarding hearing date change; Telephone conference with Audrey McGlanchey with KUT News;	9.50
06/22/18	SWC	Review and edit draft brief of respondents work on various sections of brief and review successive drafts and confer with Jane Webre regarding same; Work on exhibits and exhibit list, and finalize and file same; Telephone calls and emails regarding new trial date; Work on letter to Judge Orlinda Naranjo; Designate materials for trial notebooks; Review new blow up for trial and confer with Jane Webre regarding same; Work on appendices for brief; Emails with B. Lloyd regarding revisions to the brief; Emails regarding responding to media inquiries;	7.50
06/22/18	MWB	Draft email to Jane Webre and Sara Clark summarizing my thoughts about relators' Chapter 211 argument; Draft timeline of citizen petition for blow up; Review John Mixon's treatise for relevant portions to send to Jane; Review cases cited in support of relator's Chapter 211 argument;	4.20
06/22/18	PTP	Review correspondence and file same; Assist attorneys with preparation for trial; Assist attorney with joint exhibit list and trial exhibits; Compile exhibits to trial brief for attorneys to review and use;	4.40
06/25/18	CLD	Continue review of briefing and confer with Jane Webre regarding our arguments and how to best present them to Judge Naranjo;	0.50
06/26/18	JMW	Work on drafting demonstrative exhibits for hearing; Email correspondence with team regarding hearing preparation; Work on preparation for hearing;	3.30
06/26/18	SWC	Email to Jane Webre regarding likely CodeNEXT adoption date;	0.10
06/26/18	PTP	Review correspondence and file same; Prepare docket call announcement for hearing; Assist with preparation for hearing;	0.40
06/27/18	CLD	Continue to review briefs in preparation for hearing;	0.30

CODENEXT DISPUTE July 26, 2018

INVOICE NO. 246485 PAGE 8

DATE	INITIALS	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
06/27/18	JMW	Work on hearing preparation and finalizing demonstrative exhibits for hearing; Draft proposed judgment; Email correspondence regarding same;	3.60
06/27/18	PTP	Review correspondence and file same; Proofread demonstrative for accuracy; Prepare demonstratives to be made into exhibit boards for hearing; Assist attorney with preparation for hearing;	1.00
06/28/18	JMW	Prepare for hearing before Judge Naranjo;	4.50
06/29/18	CLD	Continue to review briefing and exhibits and confer with Jane Webre regarding preparation for trial;	0.50
06/29/18	JMW	Work on preparation for hearing; Review reply brief and much email correspondence and analysis of issues presented; Meet with City Attorney folks to prepare for hearing; Do interview with KXAN and Statesmen reporters;	6.50
06/29/18	SWC	Review Relators' rebuttal brief and emails regarding same;	0.20
06/29/18	MWB	Attend meeting with City attorneys regarding hearing on Monday; Begin reviewing relator's reply brief; Draft evidence cheat sheet regarding Fox News clip for Jane Webre;	3.10
06/29/18	PTP	Review correspondence and file same; Assist attorneys with preparation for hearing;	1.10

NAME	HOURS	RATE	AMOUNT
CASEY L. DOBSON	2.00	600.00	1,200.00
JANE M. WEBRE	0.50	560.00	280.00
JANE M. WEBRE	97.80	480.00/	46,944.00
SARA WILDER CLARK	57.00	450.00	25,650.00
MARY BYARS	35.50	250.00	8,875.00
LUIS GARCIA	2.00	150.00	300.00
CHRISTY COLLINS	0.50	150.00	75.00
PHUC PHAN	~ 23.10	150.00	3,465.00
MICHELLE BALSARA	_14.00	80.00	1,120.00
HECTOR RIVERA	_ 1.20	80.00	96.00
Totals	233.60		88,005.00

TOTAL FEES

\$ 88,005.00

CODENEXT DISPUTE July 26, 2018

INVOICE NO. 246485 PAGE 9

EXPENSES	AMOUNT
Outside Copy Service / Record Retrieval - Rainmaker	603.39
Document Technologies ; (06/22/18)	
Outside Copy Service / Record Retrieval - Rainmaker Document Technologies ; (06/20/18)	868.17
Outside Copy Service / Record Retrieval - Rainmaker Document Technologies ; (06/28/18)	465.48
Other - ProDoc, Inc. ; (06/1-30/18)	8.88
Photocopies	179.40
Online Research Services	1,754.55
Totals	3,879.87

TOTAL EXPENSES

\$ 3,879.87

TOTAL THIS INVOICE

\$ 91,884.87 dispute

0K to Pay



July 26, 2018

Anne Morgan City of Austin 301 West 2nd, 4th Floor Austin, TX 78767-10088

Dear Anne:

Please find enclosed an invoice for expenses incurred for the period shown and a remittance page. Please return the remittance page with your payment so we can properly credit your account.

If you have any questions, please let me know. If you are unable to reach me, feel free to visit with our billing department.

Sincerely

/vjr

47301



Federal I.D. No. 74-1864860

ANNE MORGAN CITY OF AUSTIN 301 WEST 2ND, 4TH FLOOR AUSTIN, TX 78701

July 26, 2018 Invoice No. 246485

REMITTANCE PAGE For Professional Service Rendered

RE: **CODENEXT DISPUTE**

TOTAL FEES

88,005.00

TOTAL EXPENSES

3,879.87

TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE

91,884.87

PLEASE RETURN THIS COPY WITH YOUR PAYMENT

Scott Douglass & McConnico LLP | Attorneys at Law





Document Number Created On Receiver Reference Document Reference Invoice Phase

RC - 5700 - 18081549837

08/15/2018

Teresa Medina

DO 5700 18080113823

246485

Pending

1 / 1

Page:

Vendor Information

Vendor Code:

Alias/DBA:

SCO4141000

Vendor Name: SCC

SCOTT DOUGLASS & MCCONNICO LLP

INTEROFFICE

Line	Unit	Condition Commodi	ty	Commodity Description Extended Description(s)	Quantity			Received SC
					Received	Rejected	Total	Amount
1		91874	CodeNEXT		0.00000	0.00000	0.00000	\$59,000.00

Reason / Comment:

Description: Outside Counsel

RECEIVED

MIN AUG 16 A II: 01

CONTROLLERS SAVABLES

INTEROFFICE

