
SCOT’
DOUGLASS
M C CO N N I Co Federal I.D. No. 74-1864860

ANNE MORGAN January 27, 2020
CITY OF AUSTIN
301 WEST 2ND, 4TH FLOOR Invoice No. 255836

AUSTIN, TX 78701
For Professional Services Rendered:

RE: ACUNA, ET AL V. COA, ETAL.

DATE INITIALS DESCRIPTION HOURS
12/13,19 JMVV Telephone conTerence with Meghan Riley regarding new lawsuit against 0.50

City regarding protest rights relating to the new Land Development Code
revision;

12/14/19 JMW Analyze new “protest rights” claims with Sara Clark; 0.50
12/14/19 SWC Review petition; Confer with Jane Webre regarding new suit against the 0.50

City related to the new land development code; Send Jane Webre prior
research regarding same;

12/16/19 SWC Review prior memoranda and correspondence regarding comprehensive 0.50
zoning enactments and notice requirements/protest rights issues
surrounding same; ‘‘

12/17/19 JMW Review materials relating to notice and protest rights regarding 1 50
comprehensive revisions of Land Development Code;

12/17/19 SWC Update research on notice requirements for comprehensive zoning 0.60
legislation; Emails and confer with Jane Webre regarding same;

12’19/19 JMW Meet with City personnel regarding new lawsuit relating to protest rights 3.50
for Land Development Code revision; Call counsel for Plaintiff to discuss
procedures and timing; Review materials regarding notice requirements;

12/19/19 SWC Emails and confer with Jane Webre regarding team meeting and next 0.10
steps/hearing timing;

12/27/19 PTP Review correspondence and file same; 0.10
12/30/19 JMW Telephone conference with Doug Becker regarding case timing and 2.50

procedural issues; Email correspondence with Anne Morgan regarding
same and how best to assemble factual record; Analyze factual record from
Code NEXT suit to determine overlap;

12/30/19 SWC Emails with Jane Webre regarding Beckertelephone call, procedural plan, 0.20
and mootness issue;

12/30/19 MWB Confer with Jane Webre about new case and previous research regarding 0.30
protest rights; Look for notes from previous research and send same to
Jane;

12/30/19 PTP Review correspondence and file same; Calendar deadlines and e-mail 0.20
same to attorney for her review and use;

oodgtass & McConnicn LLP Attorneys at Law

303 Colorado Street, Suit240O Austin, TX 78701 512.495,6300 f: 512.495.6399 www.scottdouq.com

002505.0055 —flh147q7



SCOTT DOUGLASS & MCCONNICO LLP

ACUNA, ETALV. COA, ETAL. INVOICE NO. 255836
January 27, 2020 PAGE 2

DATE INITIALS DESCRIPTION HOURS
12/31/19 SWC Emails and review prior correspondence regarding background facts; 0.20

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT
JANE M. WEBRE 8.50 480.0O” 4,080.00
SARA WILDER CLARK 2.10 45O.00 945.00
MARY BYARS 0.30 250.OOV 75.00
PHUC PHAN 0.30 150.00 45.00
Totals 11.20 - 5145.00

TOTAL FEES $ 5,14500

TOTAL EXPENSES 0.00

TOTALTHIS INVOICE 5,145.00

0025050055



SCOT’
DOUGLASS
M C Co N N I CO Federal l.D. No. 74-1864860

ANNE MORGAN January 27, 2020
CITY OF AUSTIN
301 WEST 2ND, 4TH FLOOR Invoice No. 255836

AUSTIN, TX 78701

REMIHANCE PAGE
For Professonal Service Rendered

RE: ACUNA, El AL V. COA: ETAL.

TOTAL FEES $ 5,145.00

TOTAL EXPENSES 0.00

TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE

PLEASE RETURN THIS COPY WITH YOUR PAYMENT

Scott Douglass & McConnico LLP Attorneys at Law

303 Coiorado Street, Swte 2400, Austin, TX 78(01 p : 512.495.6300 f: 512.495.6399 www.scottthug,cum
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SCOT’
DOUGLASS
McCONNICO

January 27, 2020

RECEIVED
FEB 0 3 2U2a

LAWDEPARTMENT
Anne Morgan
City of Austin
301 West 2nd 4th Floor
Austin, TX 78767-10088

Dear Anne:

Please find enclosed an invoice for expenses incurred for the period shown and a
remittance page. Please return the remittance page with your payment so we can properly
credit your account.

If you have any questions, please let me know. If you are unable to reach me, feel free
to visit with our billing department.

Sincerely,

Casey L. on

/vj r

47301

Scott Douglass & McConnico LLP I Attorneys at Law

303 Colorado Street, Suite 2400, Austin, TX 78701 p : 512.495.6300 I t: 572.495.6399 I www.scottdoug.com



• SCOTT
DOUGLASS
McCONNICO RECEI‘1LJ Federal 1.0. No. 74-1864860

MAR 09 2O

ANNE MORGAN
CITY OF AUSTIN
301 WEST 2ND, 4TH FLOOR
AUSTIN, TX 78701

For Professional Services Rendered:

LAWDEPt4 LTMENT February 29, 2020

Invoice No. 256109

RE: ACUNA, El AL V. COA, ETAL.

DATE
01/02/20
01/03/20

01/10/20
01/13/20

01/13/20
0 1/14/20
0 1/15/20
0 1/16/20

0 1/17/20
0 1/17/20
01/20/20

INITIALS
JMW
JMW

SWC
JMW

PTP
MWB
JMW
JMW

MWB
PTP
JMW

HOURS
1.00
2.10

0.10
2.20

0.10
0.20
2.40
5.30

6.30

0.50
0.30
1.50

4.30

3.00

Scott Douglass & McConnico LLP Attorneys at Law

303 Colorado Street, Suite 2400, Austin, TX 78701 p: 512.495.6300 f: 512.495.6399 I www.scottdrwq.crn

01/08/20 JMW

01/10/20 JMW

3.00

1.00

DESCRI PTION
Analyze factual record and potential stipulated facts;
Email correspondence with Doug Becker and telephone conference with
him regarding February 18 trial setting; Email correspondence with
Meghan Riley regarding stipulated facts; Telephone conference with
Meghan Riley and Debra Thomas regarding same; Review materials
regarding San Antonio LDC revision to determine notice given;
Attend meeting with City personnel and expert Brenda McDonald
regarding factual and legal issues and much analysis of demonstrative
exhibits and maps needed to illustrate notice issues;
Draft original answer and send to Meghan Riley for review with email;
Analyze whether to plead ripeness; Telephone conference with Doug
Becker regarding getting a judge assigned;
Review and send expert research to Jane Webre;
Revise, finalize and file original answer; Email correspondence with
Meghan Riley regarding same; Work on stipulations of fact;
Review correspondence and file same;
Meet with Jane Webre re research needed on notice and protest rights;
Work on stipulation of facts and analysis of record issues;
Meet with Mitzi Cotton, Erica Lopez and additional City personnel to work
on factual record and stipulations; Work on drafting stipulations;
Review Plaintiffs proposed stipulated facts and email correspondence with
City personnel regarding same; Work on drafting stipulated facts and
exhibits;
Review original petition and answer;
Review correspondence and file same; Compile exhibits for filing;
Work on stipulations of fact and email correspondence with clients
regarding same;
Meet with City personnel to work on stipulations; Research regarding
same;
Work on stipulations of fact;

01/17/20 JMW

01/22/20 JMW

01/23/20 JMW

002505.0055



SCOTT DOUGLASS & MCCONNICO LLP

ACUNA, ETALV. COA, El AL. INVOICE NO. 256109
February 29, 2020 PAGE 2

DATE INITIALS DESCRIPTION HOURS
01/24/20 JMW Work on stipulations of fact; Email correspondence with Doug Becker 5.00

regarding same;
01/26/20 MWB Begin researching notice and protest rights for comprehensive revisions; 0.50
01/27/20 MWB Research notice and protest rights for comprehensive revisions to land use 2.50

plans;
01/28/20 JMW Review information from City regarding protests filed to date; Analyze 0.30

procedure and timing issues regarding briefing;
01/28/20 MWB Confer with Jane Webre re notice and protest research; 0.30
01/28/20 PIP Review correspondence and file same; 0.10
01/29/20 JMW Review protests submitted by plaintiffs and email correspondence 0.50

regarding same; Review draft stipulations;
01/29/20 MWB Review memo from City on protest rights for comprehensive revision; 1.30
01/30/20 JMW Telephone conference with Brenda McDonald regarding expert affidavit; 5.10

Work on drafting affidavit and exhibit list; Work on stipulations and trial
brief;

01/31/20 JMW Much email correspondence with team regarding Brenda McDonald 3.50
affidavit and exhibit issues; Work on exhibit lists and trial brief;

01/31/20 MWB Continue researching protest rights relating to comprehensive revision of 1.40
land use code;

01/31/20 PTP Review correspondence and file same; 0.10

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT
JANE M. WEBRE 46.50 480.00 22,320.00
SARA WILDER CLARK 0.10 450.00 45.00
MARY BYARS 6.70 250.00 1,675.00
PHUC PHAN 0.60 180.00 108,00
Totals

TOTAL FEES $ 24,148.00

EXPENSES AMOUNT
Other- ProDoc, Inc.; (01/1-31/20) 13.32
Online Research Services 350.62
Totals 363.94

TOTAL EXPENSES 363.94

TOTALTHIS INVOICE $ 24,511.94RECEIVED
MAR 09

LAWDEPARTMENT

002S05.0055



SCOT’
DOUGLASS
M C CON N IC 0 RECEIVED Federal l.D. No. 744864860

MAR 0 9 2020

LAWDEPARTMENT
ANNE MORGAN February 29, 2020
CITY OF AUSTIN
301 WEST 2ND, 4TH FLOOR Invoice No. 256109
AUSTIN, TX 78701

REMUANCE PAGE
For Professional Service Rendered

RE: ACUNA, ET AL V. COA, ET AL.

TOTAL FEES $ 24,148.00

TOTAL EXPENSES 363.94

TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE $ 24,511.94

PREVIOUS UNPAID BALANCE DUE (See Below) $ 5,14500

TOTAL DUE

/fyou have paid anyportion of the “PREVIOUS UNPAID BALANCEDUE,” p/ease pay only “TOTAL
CURRENT/NVOICE” p/us any “PREVIOUS INVOICES” listed be/ow that have not been paid.

PREVIOUS INVOICES

DATE INVOICE INVOICE AMOUNT PAYMENT RECEIVED BALANCE
01/27/20 255836 5,145.00 0.00 5,145.00

Total 5,145.00

PLEASE RETURN THIS COPY WITH YOUR PAYMENT

Scott Douglass & McConnico LLP Attorneys at Law

303 Colorado Street, Suite 2400, Austin, TX 78701 p: 512.495.6300 f : 512.495.6399 www.scntti,uq.com

002505.0055



SCOT’
DOUGLASS
McCONNICO

Match 11,2020

RECFIVED
M1\R i3 22

Anne Morgan
City of Austin
301 West 2nd 4th Floor
Austin, TX 78767-1 0088

Dear Anne:

LAW DEPARTMENT

Please find enclosed an invoice for expenses incurred for the period shown and a
remittance page. Please return the remittance page with your payment so we can properly
credit your account.

If you have any questions, please let me know. If you are unable to reach me, feel free
to visit with our billing department.

/vj r

97374

Scott Douglass & McConnico LLP I Attorneys at Law

303 Colorado Street, Suite 2400, Austin, TX 78701 p: 512.495.6300 I f: 512.495.6399 I www.scottdoug.com
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ANNE MORGAN 
CITY OF AUSTIN 
301 WEST 2ND, 4TH FLOOR 
AUSTIN, TX 78701 

 
April 1, 2020 

Invoice No. 256419 

 

For Professional Services Rendered:  
 
RE: ACUNA, ET AL V. COA, ET AL. 
  
DATE INITIALS DESCRIPTION HOURS 
02/01/20 MWB Research case law on notice and protest rights; 0.90 
02/02/20 MWB Continue researching notice and protest rights and organize thoughts for 

meeting with Jane Webre tomorrow; 
4.60 

02/03/20 JMW Work on stipulations and trial brief; Email correspondence with Wendy 
Rhoades regarding valid protest numbers and revised demonstrative 
exhibits; Work with Mitzi Colton on Brenda McDonald affidavit; Analyze 
court docket and telephone conference with Doug Becker regarding same; 
Review revised plaintiff's stipulations; 

6.20 

02/03/20 MWB Confer with Jane Webre re briefing on notice and protest rights; 0.70 
02/03/20 PTP Review correspondence and file same; Compile potential exhibits; 

Compare documents for attorney to review and use; 
2.40 

02/04/20 JMW Meet with city personnel regarding various items for Acuna trial including 
stipulations and demonstrative exhibits; Work on developing exhibits and 
work on trial brief; 

5.10 

02/04/20 MWB Confer with Jane Webre re graphics and exhibits for notice and protest; 0.30 
02/04/20 PTP Review correspondence and file same; 0.10 
02/05/20 JMW Work on exhibit and trial brief; Analyze protest running tally spreadsheet 

with Deborah Thomas; 
3.70 

02/06/20 PTP Review correspondence and file same; Calendar trial and e-mail same to 
attorney for her review and use; 

0.20 

02/07/20 JMW Much email correspondence with Doug Becker and with City personnel 
regarding exhibits and factual record development; Work on trial brief; 
Analyze City Code provisions regarding notice; Email correspondence 
regarding potential effect of court ruling; 

4.50 

02/07/20 MWB Begin drafting argument re notice and provision for trial brief; 1.60 
02/09/20 MWB Continue drafting argument re notice and provision for trial brief; 2.80 
02/10/20 JMW Work on exhibits, stipulations; Meet with Doug Becker to work out same; 

Email correspondence with City personnel regarding same; 
6.20 

02/10/20 MWB Continue drafting argument re notice and provision for trial brief; 1.40 
02/10/20 PTP Review correspondence and file same; 0.20 

medinate
RECEIVED
April 13, 2020

medinate
TM# 76547 MLR



 
 

SCOTT DOUGLASS & MCCONNICO LLP 
 
ACUNA, ET AL V. COA, ET AL. 
April 1, 2020 

INVOICE NO. 256419 
PAGE 2 

 
 

 
002505.0055 

DATE INITIALS DESCRIPTION HOURS 
02/11/20 JMW Work on trial brief; 3.30 
02/11/20 MWB Continue drafting argument re notice and provision for trial brief; 1.70 
02/11/20 PTP Review correspondence and file same; Calendar deadlines and e-mail 

same to attorneys for their review and use; 
0.20 

02/12/20 JMW Work on trial brief; Circulate working draft to clients for review; 5.30 
02/12/20 MWB Confer with Jane Webre re trial brief arguments; 0.20 
02/12/20 PTP Review correspondence and file same; 0.10 
02/13/20 PTP Review correspondence and file same; 0.10 
02/14/20 JMW Revise stipulations and send to Doug Becker; Work on combined exhibit 

list; Review letter from Judge Sulak regarding assignment of case; Email 
correspondence regarding same; 

1.10 

02/14/20 PTP Review correspondence and file same; 0.10 
02/15/20 MWB Review and edit trial brief; 0.90 
02/17/20 PTP Review correspondence and file same; Compile additional exhibits; 1.90 
02/18/20 JMW Work on exhibits and much email correspondence with team regarding 

demonstratives; Work on trial brief; Email correspondence with Brenda 
McDonald regarding her affidavit testimony; 

3.50 

02/18/20 PTP Review correspondence and file same; 0.10 
02/19/20 JMW Work on stipulations and trial brief; Email correspondence with team 

regarding same; 
2.20 

02/19/20 PTP Review correspondence and file same; Compile exhibits; 0.90 
02/20/20 PTP Review correspondence and file same; Assist with preparation of potential 

trial exhibits and lists; 
0.50 

02/21/20 PTP Review correspondence and file same; 0.10 
02/25/20 JMW Telephone conference with Brenda McDonald regarding affidavit; Meet 

with Doug Becker regarding exhibits and stipulations; 
4.60 

02/26/20 MWB Confer with Jane Webre re updated briefing schedule; 0.10 
02/26/20 PTP Review correspondence and file same; 0.10 
02/27/20 JMW Work on trial brief and exhibits; Email correspondence with team; Review 

and analyze draft of Plaintiffs' brief; 
5.30 

02/27/20 MWB Review draft brief sent by plaintiff's counsel; Begin reviewing out of state 
case law on protest rights cited by plaintiffs; 

1.20 

02/28/20 JMW Analyze arguments and case law regarding protest rights; Meet with city 
personnel and Brenda McDonald; Work on brief; Email correspondence 
with Doug Becker regarding stipulations; 

4.50 

02/28/20 MWB Review out of state cases regarding protest rights cited by plaintiffs; 
Confer with Jane Webre re same; Begin outlining response to those cases; 

3.40 

02/28/20 PTP Review correspondence and file same; Research Austin City Council 
records for meeting transcripts and videos to determine if plaintiffs made 

1.40 



 
 

SCOTT DOUGLASS & MCCONNICO LLP 
 
ACUNA, ET AL V. COA, ET AL. 
April 1, 2020 

INVOICE NO. 256419 
PAGE 3 

 
 

 
002505.0055 

DATE INITIALS DESCRIPTION HOURS 
appearances; Comparison of original and amended petitions for attorneys 
to review and use; 

02/29/20 MWB Update trial brief to respond to out of state protest cases cited by 
plaintiffs; 

4.10 

 
 
 NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT 
 JANE M. WEBRE 55.50 480.00 26,640.00 
 MARY BYARS 23.90 250.00 5,975.00 
 PHUC PHAN 8.40 180.00 1,512.00 

        

 Totals  87.80  34,127.00 

 
   
 TOTAL FEES $ 34,127.00 
 
 
 
 EXPENSES  AMOUNT 
 Online Research Services  433.15 

   ÿ  ÿ  

 Totals  433.15 
 
 
 TOTAL EXPENSES $ 433.15 
 
 TOTAL THIS INVOICE $ 34,560.15 
 
  



 

 
 

 
 
 

Federal I.D. No. 74-1864860  
 
 

PLEASE RETURN THIS COPY WITH YOUR PAYMENT 
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ANNE MORGAN 
CITY OF AUSTIN 
301 WEST 2ND, 4TH FLOOR 
AUSTIN, TX 78701 

 
 
April 1, 2020 

Invoice No. 256419 

 
 
 

REMITTANCE PAGE 
For Professional Service Rendered 

 
 
RE: ACUNA, ET AL V. COA, ET AL. 
   
 
 TOTAL FEES $ 34,127.00 
 
 TOTAL EXPENSES  433.15 
 
  TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE $ 34,560.15 
 
 
  PREVIOUS UNPAID BALANCE DUE (See Below) $ 24,511.94 
 
  TOTAL DUE $ 59,072.09 
 
 
 
If you have paid any portion of the "PREVIOUS UNPAID BALANCE DUE," please pay only "TOTAL  
CURRENT INVOICE" plus any "PREVIOUS INVOICES" listed below that have not been paid. 
 
  PREVIOUS INVOICES 
 
 DATE INVOICE INVOICE AMOUNT PAYMENT RECEIVED  BALANCE 
 02/29/20 256109 24,511.94 0.00  24,511.94     ÿ  

 Total  24,511.94 
 
 
 



SCOT’
DOUGLASS
M C CON N I Co Federal ID. No. 744864860

ANNE MORGAN April 30, 2020
CITY OF AUSTIN
301 WEST 2ND, 4TH FLOOR

Invoice No. 257585

AUSTIN, TX 78701
For Professional Services Rendered:

RE: ACUNA, ET AL V. COA, ET AL.

DATE INITIALS DESCRIPTION HOURS
03/01/20 JMW Work on stipulations, analysis of factual record, and trial brief; Email 3.60

correspondence with team regarding neighborhood plans;
03/01/20 MWB Update trial brief to respond to out of state protest cases cited by 2.30

plaintiffs;
03/02/20 JMW Much work on stipulations, Brenda McDonald affidavit and briefing; Work 6.20

on exhibits for hearing; Work on joint exhibit finalizing;
03/02/20 MWB Confer with Jane Webre re response brief; Phone call with Jane and client 2.00

re contested fact stipulations;
03/02/20 PTP Review correspondence and file same; Research visiting judges and rules 0.90

for objecting to same; Email attorney re same; Assist attorney with
preparation for hearing; Assist attorney with preparation for trial;

03/03/20 JMW Work on trial brief and circulate draft to team for review; Continue work to 5.20
finalize exhibits and stipulations; Work with Brenda McDonald on affidavit;

03/03/20 MWB Continue drafting trial brief; Review joint stipulation of facts; 2.30
03/03/20 PTP Review correspondence and file same; Assist attorney with exhibits to 0.40

response and for trial;
03/04/20 JMW Work with Brenda McDonald to get affidavit finalized; Finalize stipulations 5.20

and exhibits; Work on trial brief; Finalize demonsttatives for hearing;
03/04/20 MWB Confer with Jane Webre re trial brief; Review brief filed by plaintiffs; Look 4.80

for case law saying council cannot adopt less restrictive zoning laws than
what was in notice;

03/04/20 PTP Review correspondence and file same; Assist attorney with review of 1.10
pleadings files; Assist attorneys with preparation for trial; Comparison of
key documents, per attorneys requests;

03/05/20 JMW Revise, finalize and file trial brief; Finalize hearing materials; Work on 5.90
arguments and preparing for hearing; Work with counsel regarding filing
amicus briefs; Review and analyze expert affidavit from Plaintiffs;

03/05/20 MWB Review Texas case law cited by plaintiffs and confer with Jane Webre re 5.10
same; Review affidavit of plaintiffs expert and email Jane with thoughts re
responses; Take notes on Texas cases cited by plaintiffs for Jane; Review
amicus brief to be filed by habitat; Review Brenda McDonalds affidavit;

Scott Douglass & McConnico LLP j Attorneys at Law

303 Colorado Street, Suite 2400, Austin, IX 78701 p: 512.495.6300 f: 512.495.6399 www.scottdoug.com

002505 .0055



SCOTT DOUGLASS & MCCONNICO LLP

ACUNA, ETALV. COA, ETAL. INVOICE NO. 257585
April 30, 2020 PAGE 2

DATE INITIALS DESCRIPTION HOURS
03/05/20 PTP Review correspondence and file same; Compile DX documents for 2.40

attorney to review and use; Assist attorney with preparation for trial;
03/06/20 JMW Prepare for hearing; Work with counsel regarding amicus filings; 6.10
03/06/20 MWB Review and circulate amicus briefs filed this afternoon; Finalize outlines 0.90

summarizing Texas law cited by plaintiffs and rebuttal points to David
Brookss affidavit for Jane Webre; Research legislative history of
211.007(d);

03/06/20 FTP Review correspondence and file same; Assist with preparation for trial; 0.40
03/07/20 JMW Prepare for hearing; 2.10
03/08/20 JMW Prepare for hearing; Analyze arguments with Mary Byars; 4.50
03/08/20 MWB Prepare for hearing tomorrow; Review reply brief filed by plaintiffs; 2.80
03/09/20 JMW Prepare and attend heating; Analyze procedural issues with team; Email 3.10

correspondence with Warren Vavra regarding getting assigned to a judge;
Interviews with Chronicle reporter;

03/09/20 MWB Prepare for and attend bench trial, which ultimately got pushed; 2.00
03/09/20 FTP Review correspondence and file same; Assist attorneys with preparation for 2.20

trial; Assist at docket call;
03/10/20 JMW Prepare for hearing; Email correspondence with Warren Vavra regarding 1 .00

setting;
03/11/20 JMW Prepare and participate in hearing on the merits; Interviews with various 8.30

media outlets;
03/11/20 MWB Prepare for and attend bench trial in Acuna v. COA; 5.30
03/11/20 PTP Review correspondence and file same; Assist attorneys at bench trial; 4.40

03/12/20 JMW Telephone conference with Meghan Reilly regarding various issues in the 0.50
wake of hearing and City Counsel inquiry; Email correspondence with
Doug Becker and Warren Vavra regarding logistics;

03/17/20 JMW Review live petition and prepare draft final judgment and circulate to 1 .00
Meghan Reilly for review; Submit proposed final judgment to the court;
Review and analyze Plaintiffs proposed final judgment;

03/1 8/20 JMW Review and analyze courts final judgment; Telephone conference with 0.50
Meghan Reilly re: same;

03/1 9/20 JMW E-mail correspondence with Meghan Reilly regarding next steps and 0.50
analysis of the final judgment;

002505 .0055



SCOTT DOUGLASS & MCCONNICO LLP

ACUNA, ET AL V. COA, ET AL. INVOICE NO. 257585
April 30, 2020 PAGE 3

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT
JANE M. WEBRE 53.70 480.00 25,776.00
MARY BYARS 27.50 250.00 6,875.00
PHUCPHAN 11.80 180.00 2,124.00
Totals 93.00 34,775.00

TOTAL FEES $ 34,775.00

EXPENSES AMOUNT
Outside Copy Service / Recotd Retrieval - Rainmaker 270.63
Document Technologies ; (03/09/20)
Other- ProDoc, Inc.; (03//i -31/20) 8.88
Photocopies 488.10
Online Research Services 402.67
Totals 1jjO.2a

TOTALEXPENSES 1,170.28

TOTAL THIS INVOICE $ 35,945.28

002505.0055



SCOT’
DOUGLASS
M C C 0 N N I C 0 Federal ID. No. 74-1864860

ANNE MORGAN April 30, 2020
CITY OF AUSTIN
301 WEST 2ND, 4TH FLOOR Invoice No. 257585

AUSTIN, TX 78701

REMIHANCE PAGE
For Professional Service Rendered

RE: ACUNA, ET AL V. COA, ET AL.

TOTAL FEES $ 34,775.00

TOTAL EXPENSES 1,170.28

TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE

PREVIOUS UNPAID BALANCE DUE (See Below) $ 34,560.1 5

TOTAL DUE S 70,505.43

/fyou haye paid anyport/on of the “PREVIOUS UNPAID BALANCEDUE, “ p/ease pay only “TOTAL
CURRENT INVOICE” p/us any “PREVIOUS INVOICES” listed be/ow that have not been paid.

PREVIOUS INVOICES

DATE INVOICE INVOICE AMOUNT PAYMENT RECEIVED BALANCE
04/01/20 256419 34,560.15 0.00 34,560.15

Total 34,56Q15

PLEASE RETURN THIS COPY WITH YOUR PAYMENT

Scott Douglass & McConnico LIP Attorneys at Law

303 Colorado Street, Suite 2400, Austin, TX 78701 p2 512.495.6300 f: 512.495.6399 www.scottdoug.com

002505.0055



SCOTT
DOUGLASS
McCONNICO

Anne Morgan
City of Austin
301 West 2nd 4th Floor
Austin, TX 78767-10088

Dear Anne:

May 8, 2020

Please find enclosed an invoice for expenses incurred for the period shown and a
remittance page. Please return the remittance page with your payment so we can properly
credit your account.

If you have any questions, please let me
to visit with our billing department.

/vj r

47301

know. If you are unable to reach me, feel free

/r%

Scott Douglass & McConnico LLP I Attorneys at Law

Sir

Casey L. Doi

303 Colorado Street, Suite 2400, Austin, IX 78701 I p: 512.495.6300 I t: 512.495.6399 I www.scottdoug.com



 

 
 

 
 
 

Federal I.D. No. 74-1864860  
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ANNE MORGAN 
CITY OF AUSTIN 
301 WEST 2ND, 4TH FLOOR 
AUSTIN, TX 78701 

 
June 1, 2020 

Invoice No. 258235 

 

For Professional Services Rendered:  
 
RE: ACUNA, ET AL V. COA, ET AL. 
  
DATE INITIALS DESCRIPTION HOURS 
04/16/20 JMW Draft and file items to appeal the final judgment, including notice of 

appeal, request for Clerk's Record, and docketing statement; E-mail 
correspondence with counsel and submit agreed order to Judge Soifer in 
order to transmit the original box of hearing exhibits to the court of 
appeals; 

2.50 

04/16/20 PTP Assist attorney with appellate filing; Coordinate with court reporter re 
reporter's records; 

1.40 

04/17/20 PTP Assist attorney with appellate filing; Coordinate with court reporter re 
reporter's records; 

0.30 

 
 
 NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT 
 JANE M. WEBRE 2.50 480.00 1,200.00 
 PHUC PHAN 1.70 180.00 306.00 

        

 Totals  4.20  1,506.00 

 
   
 TOTAL FEES $ 1,506.00 
 
 
 
 EXPENSES  AMOUNT 
 Transcripts - Michelle R Williamson ; (04/17/20)  600.00 
 Other - ProDoc, Inc. ; (04/1-30/20)  228.69 

   ÿ  ÿ  

 Totals  828.69 
 
 
 TOTAL EXPENSES $ 828.69 
 
 TOTAL THIS INVOICE $ 2,334.69 
 



 

 
 

 
 
 

Federal I.D. No. 74-1864860  
 
 

PLEASE RETURN THIS COPY WITH YOUR PAYMENT 
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Federal I.D. No. 74-1864860  
 
 

PLEASE RETURN THIS COPY WITH YOUR PAYMENT 
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ANNE MORGAN 
CITY OF AUSTIN 
301 WEST 2ND, 4TH FLOOR 
AUSTIN, TX 78701 

 
 
June 1, 2020 

Invoice No. 258235 

 
 
 

REMITTANCE PAGE 
For Professional Service Rendered 

 
 
RE: ACUNA, ET AL V. COA, ET AL. 
   
 
 TOTAL FEES $ 1,506.00 
 
 TOTAL EXPENSES  828.69 
 
  TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE $ 2,334.69 
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ANNE MORGAN 
CITY OF AUSTIN 
301 WEST 2ND, 4TH FLOOR 
AUSTIN, TX 78701 

 
June 10, 2020 

Invoice No. 258911 

 

For Professional Services Rendered:  
 
RE: ACUNA, ET AL V. COA, ET AL. 
  
DATE INITIALS DESCRIPTION HOURS 
05/04/20 JMW Telephone conference with Doug Becker regarding supersedeas issues 

and his proposed motion to have the judgment remain in force pending 
appeal; Review draft motion and order; Research rules of appellate 
procedure regarding supersedeas; E-mail correspondence with Meghan 
Riley re: same; 

1.00 

05/06/20 JMW Telephone conference with Meghan Riley re: supersedeas issues and 
whether the City can move forward with any aspects of the LDC revision 
pending appeal; Review and analyze transfer of the appeal to Fourteenth 
Court in Houston and discuss same with Meghan Riley; E-mail 
correspondence with Doug Becker re: transfer and record issues; 

1.00 

05/07/20 PTP Review correspondence and file same; Correspondence with court reporter 
re transfer of case; 

0.30 

05/08/20 JMW Work with Doug Becker towards a stipulation regarding the box of protest 
exhibits; E-mail correspondence with Meghan Riley regarding transfer to 
Fourteenth Court of Appeals and supersedeas issue; Analyze scope of 
supersedeas order and e-mail correspondence re: same; 

1.00 

05/08/20 PTP Correspondence with court reporter and attorneys re reporter's record; 0.20 
05/11/20 JMW E-mail correspondence with Judge Soifer's staff regarding supersedeas 

issue; 
0.30 

05/12/20 JMW Review order from Judge Soifer on supersedeas and e-mail 
correspondence with Meghan Riley re: same; 

0.50 

05/14/20 JMW Telephone conference with Meghan Riley re: scope of supersedeas and 
the injunctive portion of the judgment and how it may impact certain 
ongoing projects within the City; 

0.50 

05/18/20 JMW Conference call with Meghan Riley, Mitzi Cotton, Deborah Thomas and 
Brenda McDonald re: airport overlay and strategic considerations in 
seeking clarification from Judge Soifer; Analyze mootness and jurisdiction 
issues re: same; Work on getting the appellate record complete in light of 
ransomware attack that as shut down court of appeals case management 
system; 

2.00 

05/18/20 PTP Review correspondence and file same; Assist attorney with review of filings 
of clerk's and reporter's records; Inquiry with court reporter and clerk re 

0.50 

medinate
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DATE INITIALS DESCRIPTION HOURS 
same; 

05/27/20 JMW Draft request for clarification regarding the scope of the injunctive portion 
of the court's judgment; E-mail correspondence with Meghan Riley re: 
same; 

1.00 

05/29/20 JMW Telephone conference with Meghan Riley regarding additional land use 
issues the City needs to contend with and how best to present the 
question for clarification to Judge Soifer; Review and analyze draft request 
for clarification; 

1.00 

 
 
 NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT 
 JANE M. WEBRE 8.30 480.00 3,984.00 
 PHUC PHAN 1.00 180.00 180.00 

        

 Totals  9.30  4,164.00 

 
   
 TOTAL FEES $ 4,164.00 
 
 
 
 EXPENSES  AMOUNT 
 Online Research Services  336.89 

   ÿ  ÿ  

 Totals  336.89 
 
 
 TOTAL EXPENSES $ 336.89 
 
 TOTAL THIS INVOICE $ 4,500.89 
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ANNE MORGAN 
CITY OF AUSTIN 
301 WEST 2ND, 4TH FLOOR 
AUSTIN, TX 78701 

 
 
June 10, 2020 

Invoice No. 258911 

 
 
 

REMITTANCE PAGE 
For Professional Service Rendered 

 
 
RE: ACUNA, ET AL V. COA, ET AL. 
   
 
 TOTAL FEES $ 4,164.00 
 
 TOTAL EXPENSES  336.89 
 
  TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE $ 4,500.89 
 
 
  PREVIOUS UNPAID BALANCE DUE (See Below) $ 2,334.69 
 
  TOTAL DUE $ 6,835.58 
 
 
 
If you have paid any portion of the "PREVIOUS UNPAID BALANCE DUE," please pay only "TOTAL  
CURRENT INVOICE" plus any "PREVIOUS INVOICES" listed below that have not been paid. 
 
  PREVIOUS INVOICES 
 
 DATE INVOICE INVOICE AMOUNT PAYMENT RECEIVED  BALANCE 
 06/01/20 258235 2,334.69 0.00  2,334.69     ÿ  

 Total  2,334.69 
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SCOT’
DOUGLASS
M C CON N IC 0 RECEIVED Federal l.D. No. 744864860

AUG 242020

LA WDEPARTMENT August 19, 2020

301 WEST 2ND, 4TH FLOOR Invoice No. 259637

AUSTIN, TX 78701
For Professional Services Rendered:

RE: ACUNA, ET AL V. COA, ET AL.

DATE INITIALS DESCRIPTION HOURS
07/01/20 JMW Telephone conference and e-mail correspondence with Meghan Riley 3.80

regarding request for clarification of the scope of injunction and analyze
best way to present to City Council for agreement; Revise request for
clarification: Work on brief of appellants; Follow up with Doug Becker
regarding stipulation regarding the box of protest forms;

07/02/20 JMW Telephone conference with Doug Becker re request for clarification and e- 2.50
mail correspondence re: same to send him draft pleading: revise finalize,
and file stipulation regarding the box of protest forms; Work on brief of
appellants, including organizing the appendix items from the Clerks
Record; Work on brief of appellants and circulate draft to Meghan Riley for
review and comment;

07/02/20 PTP Review correspondence and file same; Compile appendices to brief for 0.60
attorney to review and use;

07/06/20 JMW Work on brief of appellants, including analysis of out of state case 1 .50
reflecting amicus activity as hallmark of legislative process; E-mail
correspondence with Doug Becker regarding request for clarification;
Analyze jurisdiction issue with Meghan Riley and research re: same;

07/06/20 MWB Search case law for any new, relevant case, and emails with Jane Webre re 2.50
same; Update brief with new DC case and email Jane re same;

07/08/20 JMW Telephone conference with Doug Becker regarding request for clarification 1 .50
and report to Meghan Riley re: same;

07/09/20 JMW E-mail correspondence with Meghan Riley regarding plaintiffs opposition 2.50
on request for clarification and the fact that scope of the judgment is at
issue in the appeal; Work on revising that portion of the brief of appellants
and research re: same;

07/13/20 JMW Work on brief of appellants, particularly last section regarding the proper 1 .70
scope of the final judgment; Research re: same;

07/13/20 MWB Review and edit appellate brief; Research argument that final judgment is 4.00
overbroad; Add argument re same to brief and send to Jane Webre for
review;

07/14/20 JMW Work on Brief of Appellants; 2.50

Scott Douglass & McConnico LLP Attorneys at Law

303 Colorado Street, Suite 2400, Austin, IX 78701 p: 512.495.6300 f: 512.495.6399 www.scottdotiq.:om

002505.0055
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SCOTT DOUGLASS & MCCaNN CO LLF

ACUNA, ET AL V. COA, ET AL. INVOICE NO. 259637
August 19, 2020 PAGE 2

DATE NITIALS DESCRIPTION HOURS
07/1 5/20 JMW Revise, finalize and file Brief of Appellants; Telephone conference with 3.00

Meghan Riley re: brief and request for clarification;
07/16/20 JMW Revise, finalize and file request for clarification; E-mail correspondence with 1 .50

court coordinator re: submitting it or setting or a hearing; E-mail
correspondence with Meghan Riley re: same;

07/17/20 JMW Review Plaintiffs response to the request for clarification and e-mail with 1 .00
Meghan Riley re: same;

07/28/20 JMW Draft and file reply on request for clarification; E-mail correspondence with 2.50
Meghan Riley and court coordinator re: same;

07/30/20 JMW Analyze potential next steps with Meghan Riley after receiving Judge 0.50
Soifers ruling that she lacks jurisdiction to rule on the request for
clarification;

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT
JANE M. WEBRE 24.50 480.00 11,760.00
MARY BYARS 6.50 250.00 1,625.00
PHUC PHAN 0.60 180.00 108.00
Totals 31.60 134230

TOTAL FEES $ 13,493.00

EXPENSES AMOUNT
Other- ProDoc, Inc.; (07/1-31/20) 22.20
Online Research Services 1,591,03
Totals 1613.23

TOTALEXPENSES 1,613.23

TOTAL THIS INVOICE S 15,106.23

RECEIVED
AUG 24a...,

LAWDEP,4 I?TNT
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SCOT’
DOUGLASS
M C CON N IC 0 IVI’D Federal ID. No. 741864860

AUG 242020

LAWbEPARTMENT
ANNE MORGAN August 19, 2020
CITY OF AUSTIN
301 WEST 2ND, 4TH FLOOR Invoice No. 259637

AUSTIN, TX 78701

REMIHANCE PAGE
For Professional Service Rendered

RE: ACUNA, ET AL V. COA, ET AL.

TOTALFEES $ 13,493.00

TOTAL EXPENSES 1,613.23

TOTALCURRENTINVOICE S 15,10623

PREVIOUS UNPAID BALANCE DUE (See Below) $ 17,157.77

TOTAL DUE

Ifyou have paid anyportion of the “PREVIOUS UNPAID BALANCEDUE, “p/ease pay only “TOTAL
CURRENT INVOICE” plus any “PREVIOUS INVOICES” listed below that have not been paid.

PREVIOUS INVOICES

DATE INVOICE INVOICE AMOUNT PAYMENT RECEIVED BALANCE
06/10/20 258911 4,572.89 0.00 4,572.89
07/13/20 259009 12,584.88 0.00 12,584.88

Total 17,157.77

PLEASE RETURN THIS COPY WITH YOUR PAYMENT

Scott Douglass & McConnico LLP Attorneys at Law

303 Colorado Street, Suite 2400, Austin, IX 78701 p : 512.495.6300 f: 512.495.6399 www.sr.ottdoug.com
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SCOT’
DOUGLASS
McCONNICO

August 19, 2020

RECEIVED
AU 242U2’

Anne Morgan TCity of Austin LA1’ DEPAR1ME
301 West 2nd 4th Floor
Austin, TX 78767-10088

Dear Anne:

Please find enclosed an invoice for expenses incurred for the period shown and a
remittance page. Please return the remittance page with your payment so we can properly
credit your account.

If you have any questions, please let me know. If you are unable to reach me, feel free
to visit with our billing department.

Sincerely,
.

Jane M. Webre

/vj r

99715

Scott Douglass & McConnico LLP I Attorneys at Law

303 Colorado Street, Suite 2400, Austin, TX 78701 I p: 512.495.6300 ft 512.495.6399 I www.scottdoug.com


